BiLL No. 26 oF 2015

THE FINANCE BILL, 2015

(AS INTRODUCED IN LOK SABHA)



THE FINANCE BILL, 2015

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES

CHAPTER |
PRELIMINARY
CLAUSES
1. Short title and commencement.
CHAPTER I

RATES OF INCOME-TAX
Income-tax.
CHAPTER Il
DIRECT TAXES
Income-tax

Amendment of section 2.
Amendment of section 6.
Amendment of section 9.
Insertion of new section 9A.
Amendment of section 10.
Amendment of section 11.
Amendment of section 13.
Amendment of section 32.
Insertion of new section 32AD.
Amendment of section 35.
Amendment of section 47.
Amendment of section 49.
Amendment of section 80C.
Amendment of section 80CCC.
Amendment of section 80CCD.
Amendment of section 80D.
Amendment of section 80DD.
Amendment of section 80DDB.
Amendment of section 80G.
Amendment of section 80JJAA.
Amendment of section 80U.
Amendment of section 92BA.
Amendment of section 95.
Amendment of section 111A.
Amendment of section 115A.
Amendment of section 115ACA.
Amendment of section 115JB.
Amendment of section 115U.
Amendment of section 115UA.
Insertion of new Chapter XII-FB.



CLAUSES

33.
34.
35.
36.
37.
38.
39.
40.
41.
42.
43.
44,
45,
46.
47.
48.
49.
50.
51.
52.
53.
54.
55.
56.
57.
58.
59.
60.
61.
62.
63.
64.
65.
66.
67.
68.
69.
70.
71.
72.
73.
74.
75.
76.
77.
78.

79.

80.
81.

(ii)

Amendment of section 132B.
Amendment of section 139.
Substitution of new section for section 151.
Amendment of section 153C.
Amendment of section 154.
Amendment of section 156.
Insertion of new section 158AA.
Amendment of section 192.
Insertion of new section 192A.
Amendment of section 194A.
Amendment of section 194C.
Amendment of section 194-1.
Amendment of section 194LBA.
Insertion of new section 194LBB.
Amendment of section 194LD.
Amendment of section 195.
Amendment of section 197A.
Amendment of section 200.
Amendment of section 200A.
Amendment of section 203A.
Amendment of section 206C.
Insertion of new section 206CB.
Amendment of section 220.
Amendment of section 234B.
Amendment of section 245A.
Amendment of section 245D.
Amendment of section 245H.
Amendment of section 245HA.
Amendment of section 245K.
Amendment of section 246A.
Amendment of section 253.
Amendment of section 255.
Amendment of section 263.
Substitution of new section for section 269SS.
Amendment of section 269T.
Amendment of section 271.
Amendment of section 271D.
Amendment of section 271E.
Insertion of new section 271FAB.
Insertion of new section 271GA.
Insertion of new section 271-1.
Amendment of section 272A.
Amendment of section 273B.
Insertion of new section 285A.
Amendment of section 288.
Amendment of section 295.
Wealth-tax

Amendment of Act 27 of 1957.

CHAPTER IV
INDIRECT TAXES
Customs

Amendment of section 28.
Amendment of section 112.



(i)
CLAUSES

82. Amendment of section 114.
83. Amendment of section 127A.
84. Amendment of section 127B.
85. Amendment of section 127C.
86. Omission of section 127E.
87. Amendment of section 127H.
88. Amendment of section 127L.

Customs Tariff
89. Amendment of First Schedule.
Central Excise

90. Amendment of section 3A.
91. Amendment of section 11A.
92. Substitution of new section for section 11AC.
93. Amendment of section 31.
94. Amendment of section 32.
95. Amendment of section 32B.
96. Amendment of section 32E.
97. Amendment of section 32F.
98. Omission of section 32H.
99. Amendment of section 32K.
100. Amendment of section 32-0.
101. Amendment of section 37.
102. Amendment of notification issued under section 5A of Central Excise Act.

103. Amendment of Third Schedule.
Central Excise Tariff

104. Amendment of First Schedule.

CHAPTER V
SERVICE TAX

105. Amendment of section 65B.

106. Amendment of section 66B.

107. Amendment of section 66D.

108. Amendment of section 66F.

109. Amendment of section 67.

110. Amendment of section 73.

111. Substitution of new section for section 76.
112. Substitution of new section for section 78.
113. Insertion of new section 78B.

114. Omission of section 80.

115. Amendment of section 86.

116. Amendment of section 94.

CHAPTER VI
SWACHH BHARAT CESS

117. Swachh Bharat Cess.

CHAPTER VII
PuBLic DEBT MANAGEMENT AGENCY

118. Extent and commencement of this Chapter.
119. Definitions.



(iv)
CLAUSES

120. Establishment and incorporation of the Public Debt Management Agency.
121. Objective of the Agency.

122. Board of Agency.

123. Composition of Board.

124. Debt, cash and contingent liability management.
125. Issue of Government Securities.

126. Payment of Government Securities.

127. Register of holders of Government Securities.
128. Nomination.

129. Transfer of Government Securities.

130. Fungibility and Transferability.

131. Certificate of Government Securities.

132. Liability for financial transactions.

133. Fees.
134. Grants and loans.
135. Fund.

136. Accounts, audit and reports.

137. Power of Central Government to issue directions.

138. Power of Central Government to make rules.

139. Members and employees of Agency to be public servants.
140. Protection of action taken in good faith.

141. Exemption from taxes.

142. Obligation of Reserve Bank to provide information.

CHAPTER VI
SENIOR CITIZENS' WELFARE FUND

143. Extent and commencement.

144. Definitions.

145. Establishment of Fund.

146. Constitution of a Committee for administration of Fund.
147. Payment of Claims.

148. Publication of information.

149. Escheat to Central Government.

150. Reporting of accounts and audit.

151. Power of Central Government to make rules.
152. Power to exempt in certain cases.

153. Power to remove difficulties.

CHAPTER IX
MISCELLANEOUS

PART |
AMENDMENTS TO THE RESERVE BANK OF INDIA ACT, 1934

154. Commencement and amendment of Act 2 of 1934.
155. Amendment of section 21.

156. Amendment of section 45U.

157. Amendment of section 45W.

PART Il
AMENDMENTS TO THE FORWARD CONTRACTS (REGULATION) ACT, 1952

158. Commencement and amendment of Act 74 of 1952.
159. Insertion of new sections 29A and 29B.



v)
CLAUSES

PART IlI
AMENDMENTS TO THE SECURITIES CONTRACTS (REGULATION) ACT, 1956

160. Commencement and amendment of Act 42 of 1956.
161. Amendment of section 18A.
162. Insertion of new section 30A.

PART IV
AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE (No.2) ACT, 1998

163. Amendment of Second Schedule.

PART V
AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE ACT, 1999

164. Amendment of Second Schedule.

PART VI

AMENDMENTS TO THE FOREIGN EXCHANGE MANAGEMENT ACT, 1999
165. Commencement and amendment of Act 42 of 1999.
166. Amendment of section 6.
167. Amendment of section 18.
168. Insertion of new section 37A.
169. Amendment of section 46.
170. Amendment of section 47.

PART VII
AMENDMENTS TO THE PREVENTION OF MONEY-LAUNDERING ACT, 2002

171. Amendment of section 2.
172. Amendment of section 5.
173. Amendment of section 8.
174. Amendment of section 20.
175. Amendment of section 21.
176. Amendment of section 60.
177. Amendment of Schedule.

PART VIII
AMENDMENT TO THE FISCAL RESPONSIBILITY AND BUDGET MANAGEMENT ACT, 2003

178. Amendment of section 4.

PART IX
AMENDMENTS TO THE FINANCE (No.2) ACT, 2004

179. Omission of section 95.
180. Amendment of section 97.
181. Amendment of section 98.
182. Amendment of section 100.
183. Amendment of section 101.



(vi)
CLAUSES
PART X
AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE ACT, 2005

184. Amendment of Seventh Schedule.

PART XI
AMENDMENTS TO THE GOVERNMENT SECURITIES ACT, 2006

185. Commencement and amendment of Act 38 of 2006.
186. Insertion of new section 35A.

PART Xl
AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE ACT, 2007

187. Omission of section 140.

PART Xl
AMENDMENT TO THE FINANCE ACT, 2010

188. Amendment of Tenth Schedule.

THE FIRST SCHEDULE.
THE SECOND SCHEDULE.
THE THIRD SCHEDULE.
THE FOURTH SCHEDULE.
THE FIFTH SCHEDULE.



5

10

15

20

25

30

35

AS INTRODUCED IN LOK SABHA
ON 28TH FEBRUARY, 2015

Bill No. 26 of 2015

THE FINANCE BILL, 2015
A

BILL
to give effect to the financial proposals of the Central Government for the financial year 2015-2016.

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—
CHAPTER |
PRELIMINARY

1. (1) This Act may be called the Finance Act, 2015. Short title and

. ) commencement.
(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, sections 2 to 79 shall be deemed to have come into force

on the 1st day of April, 2015.
CHAPTER Il

RATES OF INCOME-TAX

2. (1) Subject to the provisions of sub-sections (2) and (3), for the assessment year commencing on Income-tax.
the 1st day of April, 2015, income-tax shall be charged at the rates specified in Part | of the First
Schedule and such tax shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated in
each case in the manner provided therein.

(2) In the cases to which Paragraph A of Part | of the First Schedule applies, where the assessee
has, in the previous year, any net agricultural income exceeding five thousand rupees, in addition to
total income, and the total income exceeds two lakh fifty thousand rupees, then,—

(a) the net agricultural income shall be taken into account, in the manner provided in clause (b)
[that is to say, as if the net agricultural income were comprised in the total income after the first two
lakh fifty thousand rupees of the total income but without being liable to tax], only for the purpose of
charging income-tax in respect of the total income; and

(b) the income-tax chargeable shall be calculated as follows:—

(i) the total income and the net agricultural income shall be aggregated and the amount of
income-tax shall be determined in respect of the aggregate income at the rates specified in the
said Paragraph A, as if such aggregate income were the total income;

(i) the net agricultural income shall be increased by a sum of two lakh fifty thousand rupees,
and the amount of income-tax shall be determined in respect of the net agricultural income as so
increased at the rates specified in the said Paragraph A, as if the net agricultural income as so
increased were the total income;

(iii) the amount of income-tax determined in accordance with sub-clause (i) shall be reduced
by the amount of income-tax determined in accordance with sub-clause (ii) and the sum so
arrived at shall be the income-tax in respect of the total income:

Provided that in the case of every individual, being a resident in India, who is of the age of sixty
years or more but less than eighty years at any time during the previous year, referred to in item (ll)
of Paragraph A of Part | of the First Schedule, the provisions of this sub-section shall have effect as
if for the words “two lakh fifty thousand rupees”, the words “three lakh rupees” had been substituted:

Provided further that in the case of every individual, being a resident in India, who is of the age of
eighty years or more at any time during the previous year, referred to in item (lll) of Paragraph A of
Part | of the First Schedule, the provisions of this sub-section shall have effect as if for the words
“two lakh fifty thousand rupees”, the words “five lakh rupees” had been substituted.



2

(3) In cases to which the provisions of Chapter XII or Chapter XII-A or section 115JB or section
115JC or Chapter XII-FA or sub-section (1A) of section 161 or section 164 or section 164A or section
167B of the Income-tax Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as the Income-tax Act) apply, the tax chargeable
shall be determined as provided in that Chapter or that section, and with reference to the rates imposed
by sub-section (1) or the rates as specified in that Chapter or section, as the case may be:

Provided that the amount of income-tax computed in accordance with the provisions of section
111A or section 112 of the Income-tax Act shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the
Union, as provided in Paragraph A, B, C, D or E, as the case may be, of Part | of the First Schedule:

Provided further that in respect of any income chargeable to tax under section 115A, 115AB, 115AC,
115ACA, 115AD, 115B, 115BB, 115BBA, 115BBC, 115BBD, 115BBE, 115E, 115JB or 115JC of the
Income-tax Act, the amount of income-tax computed under this sub-section shall be increased by a
surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated,—

(a) in the case of every individual or Hindu undivided family or association of persons or body of
individuals, whether incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical person referred to in sub-clause
(vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act, or co-operative society or firm or local authority,
at the rate of ten per cent. of such income-tax, where the total income exceeds one crore rupees;

(b) in the case of every domestic company,—

(i) at the rate of five per cent. of such income-tax, where the total income exceeds one crore
rupees but does not exceed ten crore rupees;

(i) at the rate of ten per cent. of such income-tax, where the total income exceeds ten crore
rupees;

(c) in the case of every company, other than a domestic company,—

(i) at the rate of two per cent. of such income-tax, where the total income exceeds one crore
rupees but does not exceed ten crore rupees;

(ii) at the rate of five per cent. of such income-tax, where the total income exceeds ten
crore rupees:

Provided also that in the case of persons mentioned in (a), having total income chargeable to tax
under section 115JC of the Income-tax Act and such income exceeds one crore rupees, the total
amount payable as income-tax on such income and surcharge thereon shall not exceed the total
amount payable as income-tax on a total income of one crore rupees by more than the amount of
income that exceeds one crore rupees:

Provided also that in the case of every company having total income chargeable to tax under section
115JB of the Income-tax Act, and such income exceeds one crore rupees but does not exceed ten
crore rupees, the total amount payable as income-tax on such income and surcharge thereon, shall
not exceed the total amount payable as income-tax on a total income of one crore rupees by more than
the amount of income that exceeds one crore rupees:

Provided also that in the case of every company having total income chargeable to tax under section
115JB of the Income-tax Act, and such income exceeds ten crore rupees, the total amount payable as
income-tax on such income and surcharge thereon, shall not exceed the total amount payable as
income-tax and surcharge on a total income of ten crore rupees by more than the amount of income
that exceeds ten crore rupees.

(4) In cases in which tax has to be charged and paid under section 115-O or section 115QA or
sub-section (2) of section 115R or section 115TA of the Income-tax Act, the tax shall be charged and
paid at the rates as specified in those sections and shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of
the Union, calculated at the rate of twelve per cent. of such tax.

(5) In cases in which tax has to be deducted under sections 193, 194, 194A, 194B, 194BB, 194D,
194LBA and 195 of the Income-tax Act, at the rates in force, the deductions shall be made at the rates
specified in Part Il of the First Schedule and shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the
Union, calculated in cases wherever prescribed, in the manner provided therein.

(6) In cases in which tax has to be deducted under sections 192A, 194C, 194DA, 194E, 194EE,
194F, 194G, 194H, 194-1,194-1A, 194, 194LA, 194LB, 194LBA, 194LBB, 194LC, 194LD, 196B, 196C
and 196D of the Income-tax Act, the deductions shall be made at the rates specified in those sections
and shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the Union,—

(a) in the case of every individual or Hindu undivided family or association of persons or body of
individuals, whether incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical person referred to in sub-clause

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

55

43 of 1961.



10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

55

3

(vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act, or co-operative society or firm, being a
non-resident, calculated at the rate of twelve per cent. of such tax, where the income or the aggregate
of such incomes paid or likely to be paid and subject to the deduction exceeds one crore rupees;

(b) in the case of every company, other than a domestic company, calculated,—

(i) at the rate of two per cent. of such tax, where the income or the aggregate of such incomes
paid or likely to be paid and subject to the deduction exceeds one crore rupees but does not
exceed ten crore rupees;

(i) at the rate of five per cent. of such tax, where the income or the aggregate of such incomes
paid or likely to be paid and subject to the deduction exceeds ten crore rupees.

(7) In cases in which tax has to be collected under the proviso to section 194B of the Income-tax
Act, the collection shall be made at the rates specified in Part Il of the First Schedule, and shall be
increased by a surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated, in cases wherever prescribed, in the
manner provided therein.

(8) In cases in which tax has to be collected under section 206C of the Income-tax Act, the collection
shall be made at the rates specified in that section and shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes
of the Union,—

(a) in the case of every individual or Hindu undivided family or association of persons or body of
individuals, whether incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical person referred to in sub-clause
(vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act, or co-operative society or firm, being a
non-resident, calculated at the rate of twelve per cent. of such tax, where the amount or the aggregate
of such amounts collected and subject to the collection exceeds one crore rupees;

(b) in the case of every company, other than a domestic company, calculated—

(i) at the rate of two per cent. of such tax, where the amount or the aggregate of such amounts
collected and subject to the collection exceeds one crore rupees but does not exceed ten crore
rupees;

(i) at the rate of five per cent. of such tax, where the amount or the aggregate of such amounts
collected and subject to the collection exceeds ten crore rupees.

(9) Subiject to the provisions of sub-section (10), in cases in which income-tax has to be charged
under sub-section (4) of section 172 or sub-section (2) of section 174 or section 174A or section 175 or
sub-section (2) of section 176 of the Income-tax Act or deducted from, or paid on, income chargeable
under the head “Salaries” under section 192 of the said Act or in which the “advance tax” payable
under Chapter XVII-C of the said Act has to be computed at the rate or rates in force, such income-tax
or, as the case may be, “advance tax” shall be so charged, deducted or computed at the rate or rates
specified in Part Il of the First Schedule and such tax shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes
of the Union, calculated in such cases and in such manner as provided therein:

Provided that in cases to which the provisions of Chapter XII or Chapter XII-A or section 115JB or
section 115JC or Chapter XII-FA or Chapter XII-FB or sub-section (IA) of section 161 or section 164 or
section 164A or section 167B of the Income-tax Act apply, “advance tax” shall be computed with
reference to the rates imposed by this sub-section or the rates as specified in that Chapter or section,
as the case may be:

Provided further that the amount of “advance tax” computed in accordance with the provisions of
section 111A or section 112 of the Income-tax Act shall be increased by a surcharge, for purposes of
the Union, as provided in Paragraph A, B, C, D or E, as the case may be, of Part Ill of the First
Schedule:

Provided also that in respect of any income chargeable to tax under sections 115A, 115AB, 115AC,
115ACA, 115AD, 115B, 115BB, 115BBA, 115BBC, 115BBD, 1I5BBE, 115E, 115JB and 115JC of the
Income-tax Act, “advance tax” computed under the first proviso shall be increased by a surcharge, for
purposes of the Union, calculated,—

(a) inthe case of every individual or Hindu undivided family or association of persons or body of
individuals, whether incorporated or not, or every atrtificial juridical person referred to in sub-clause
(vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act, or co-operative society or firm or local authority,
calculated at the rate of twelve per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total income exceeds one
crore rupees;

(b) in the case of every domestic company, calculated,—

(i) at the rate of seven per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total income exceeds one
crore rupees but does not exceed ten crore rupees;



4

(i) at the rate of twelve per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total income exceeds ten
crore rupees;

(c) in the case of every company, other than a domestic company, calculated,—

(i) at the rate of two per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total income exceeds one crore
rupees but does not exceed ten crore rupees;

(i) at the rate of five per cent. of such “advance tax”, where the total income exceeds ten
crore rupees:

Provided also that in the case of persons mentioned in (a) above, having total income chargeable to
tax under section 115JC of the Income-tax Act and such income exceeds one crore rupees, the total
amount payable as “advance tax” on such income and surcharge thereon shall not exceed the total
amount payable as “advance tax” on a total income of one crore rupees by more than the amount of
income that exceeds one crore rupees:

Provided also that in the case of every company having total income chargeable to tax under section
115JB of the Income-tax Act, and such income exceeds one crore rupees but does not exceed ten
crore rupees, the total amount payable as “advance tax” on such income and surcharge thereon, shall
not exceed the total amount payable as “advance tax” on a total income of one crore rupees by more
than the amount of income that exceeds one crore rupees:

Provided also that in the case of every company having total income chargeable to tax under section
115JB of the Income-tax Act, and such income exceeds ten crore rupees, the total amount payable as
“advance tax” on such income and surcharge thereon, shall not exceed the total amount payable as
“advance tax” and surcharge on a total income of ten crore rupees by more than the amount of income
that exceeds ten crore rupees.

(10) In cases to which Paragraph A of Part Ill of the First Schedule applies, where the assessee has,
in the previous year or, if by virtue of any provision of the Income-tax Act, income-tax is to be charged
in respect of the income of a period other than the previous year, in such other period, any net agricultural
income exceeding five thousand rupees, in addition to total income and the total income exceeds two
lakh fifty thousand rupees, then, in charging income-tax under sub-section (2) of section 174 or section
174A or section 175 or sub-section (2) of section 176 of the said Act or in computing the “advance tax”
payable under Chapter XVII-C of the said Act, at the rate or rates in force,—

(a) the net agricultural income shall be taken into account, in the manner provided in clause (b)
[that is to say, as if the net agricultural income were comprised in the total income after the first two
lakh fifty thousand rupees of the total income but without being liable to tax], only for the purpose of
charging or computing such income-tax or, as the case may be, “advance tax” in respect of the total
income; and

(b) such income-tax or, as the case may be, “advance tax” shall be so charged or computed
as follows:—

(i) the total income and the net agricultural income shall be aggregated and the amount of
income-tax or “advance tax” shall be determined in respect of the aggregate income at the rates
specified in the said Paragraph A, as if such aggregate income were the total income;

(i) the net agricultural income shall be increased by a sum of two lakh fifty thousand rupees,
and the amount of income-tax or “advance tax” shall be determined in respect of the net agricultural
income as so increased at the rates specified in the said Paragraph A, as if the net agricultural
income were the total income;

(iii) the amount of income-tax or “advance tax” determined in accordance with sub-clause (i)
shall be reduced by the amount of income-tax or, as the case may be, “advance tax” determined
in accordance with sub-clause (ii) and the sum so arrived at shall be the income-tax or, as the
case may be, “advance tax” in respect of the total income:

Provided that in the case of every individual, being a resident in India, who is of the age of sixty
years or more but less than eighty years at any time during the previous year, referred to in item (ll) of
Paragraph A of Part Il of the First Schedule, the provisions of this sub-section shall have effect as if for
the words “two lakh fifty thousand rupees”, the words “three lakh rupees” had been substituted:

Provided further that in the case of every individual, being a resident in India, who is of the age of
eighty years or more at any time during the previous year, referred to in item (lll) of Paragraph A of Part
Il of the First Schedule, the provisions of this sub-section shall have effect as if for the words “two lakh
fifty thousand rupees”, the words “five lakh rupees” had been substituted:

Provided also that the amount of income-tax or “advance tax” so arrived at, shall be increased by a
surcharge for purposes of the Union calculated in each case, in the manner provided therein.

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

55



15 of 1992.

15 of 1992.

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

5

(11) The amount of income-tax as specified in sub-sections (1) to (10) and as increased by the
applicable surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated in the manner provided therein, shall be
further increased by an additional surcharge, for purposes of the Union, to be called the “Education
Cess on income-tax”, calculated at the rate of two per cent. of such income-tax and surcharge so as to
fulfil the commitment of the Government to provide and finance universalised quality basic education:

Provided that nothing contained in this sub-section shall apply to cases in which tax is to be deducted
or collected under the sections of the Income-tax Act mentioned in sub-sections (5), (6), (7) and (8), if
the income subjected to deduction of tax at source or collection of tax at source is paid to a domestic
company and any other person who is resident in India.

(12) The amount of income-tax as specified in sub-sections (1) to (10) and as increased by the
applicable surcharge, for purposes of the Union, calculated in the manner provided therein, shall also
be increased by an additional surcharge, for purposes of the Union, to be called the “Secondary and
Higher Education Cess on income-tax”, calculated at the rate of one per cent. of such income-tax and
surcharge so as to fulfil the commitment of the Government to provide and finance secondary and
higher education:

Provided that nothing contained in this sub-section shall apply to cases in which tax is to be deducted
or collected under the sections of the Income-tax Act mentioned in sub-sections (5), (6), (7) and (8), if
the income subjected to deduction of tax at source or collection of tax at source is paid to a domestic
company and any other person who is resident in India.

(13) For the purposes of this section and the First Schedule,—

(a) “domestic company” means an Indian company or any other company which, in respect of its
income liable to income-tax under the Income-tax Act, for the assessment year commencing on the
1st day of April, 2015, has made the prescribed arrangements for the declaration and payment
within India of the dividends (including dividends on preference shares) payable out of such income;

(b) “insurance commission” means any remuneration or reward, whether by way of commission
or otherwise, for soliciting or procuring insurance business (including business relating to the
continuance, renewal or revival of policies of insurance);

(c) “net agricultural income”, in relation to a person, means the total amount of agricultural income,
from whatever source derived, of that person computed in accordance with the rules contained in
Part IV of the First Schedule;

(d) all other words and expressions used in this section and the First Schedule but not defined in
this sub-section and defined in the Income-tax Act shall have the meanings, respectively, assigned
to them in that Act.

CHAPTER Il
DIRECT TAXES
Income-tax
3. In section 2 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016,—
(a) for clause (13A), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
‘(13A) “business trust” means a trust registered as,—

(i) an Infrastructure Investment Trust under the Securities and Exchange Board of India
(Infrastructure Investment Trusts) Regulations, 2014 made under the Securities and Exchange
Board of India Act, 1992; or

(i) a Real Estate Investment Trust under the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Real
Estate Investment Trusts) Regulations, 2014 made under the Securities and Exchange Board
of India Act, 1992, and

the units of which are required to be listed on recognised stock exchange in accordance with the
aforesaid regulations;’;

(b) in clause (15),—
(i) after the word “education,”, the word “yoga,” shall be inserted;
(i) for the first and the second provisos, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that the advancement of any other object of general public utility shall not be a
charitable purpose, if it involves the carrying on of any activity in the nature of trade, commerce

Amendment of
section 2.



6

or business, or any activity of rendering any service in relation to any trade, commerce or
business, for a cess or fee or any other consideration, irrespective of the nature of use or
application, or retention, of the income from such activity, unless—

(i) such activity is undertaken in the course of actual carrying out of such advancement
of any other object of general public utility; and

(i) the aggregate receipts from such activity or activities during the previous year, do not
exceed twenty per cent. of the total receipts, of the trust or institution undertaking such
activity or activities, of that previous year;”;

(c) in clause (37A), in sub-clause (iii), after the words “for the purposes of deduction of tax under”,
the words, figures and letters “section 194LBA or” shall be inserted;

(d) in clause (42A), in the Explanation 1, in clause (i), after sub-clause (hc), the following
sub-clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(hd) in the case of a capital asset, being a unit or units, which becomes the property of the
assessee in consideration of a transfer referred to in clause (xviii) of section 47, there shall be
included the period for which the unit or units in the consolidating scheme of the mutual fund
were held by the assesse;”".

Amendment 4. In section 6 of the Income-tax Act,—
of section 6.

(i) in clause (1), the Explanation shall be numbered as Explanation 1 thereof and after Explanation
1 as so numbered, the following Explanation shall be inserted, namely:—

“Explanation 2.—For the purposes of this clause, in the case of an individual, being a citizen of
India and a member of the crew of a foreign bound ship leaving India, the period or periods of
stay in India shall, in respect of such voyage, be determined in the manner and subject to such
conditions as may be prescribed.”;

(i) for clause (3), the following clause shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of
April, 2016, namely:—

‘(3) A company is said to be resident in India in any previous year, if,—
(i) it is an Indian company; or
(ii) its place of effective management, at any time in that year, is in India.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause “place of effective management” means a place
where key management and commercial decisions that are necessary for the conduct of the
business of an entity as a whole are, in substance made.’.

Afmend_megt 5. In section 9 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016,—
of section 9.

(A) in clause (i), after Explanation 5, the following Explanations shall be inserted, namely:—
‘Explanation 6.—For the purposes of this clause, it is hereby declared that—

(a) the share or interest, referred to in Explanation 5, shall be deemed to derive its value
substantially from the assets (whether tangible or intangible) located in India, if, on the specified
date, the value of such assets—

(i) exceeds the amount of ten crore rupees; and

(i) represents at least fifty per cent. of the value of all the assets owned by the company
or entity, as the case may be;

(b) the value of an asset shall be the value as on the specified date, of such asset without
reduction of liabilities, if any, in respect of the asset, determined in such manner as may be
prescribed,;

(c) “specified date” means the—

(i) date on which the accounting period of the company or, as the case may be, the entity
ends preceding the date of transfer of a share or an interest; or

(ii) date of transfer, if the book value of the assets of the company or, as the case may be,
the entity on the date of transfer exceeds the book value of the assets as on the date
referred to in sub-clause (i), by fifteen per cent.;

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45



10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

55

7

(d) “accounting period” means each period of twelve months ending with the 31st day of
March:

Provided that where a company or an entity, referred to in Explanation 5, regularly adopts a
period of twelve months ending on a day other than the 31st day of March for the purpose of—

(i) complying with the provisions of the tax laws of the territory, of which it is a resident, for
tax purposes; or

(i) reporting to persons holding the share or interest,

then, the period of twelve months ending with the other day shall be the accounting period of
the company or, as the case may be, the entity:

Provided further that the first accounting period of the company or, as the case may be, the
entity shall begin from the date of its registration or incorporation and end with the 31st day of
March or such other day, as the case may be, following the date of such registration or
incorporation, and the later accounting period shall be the successive periods of twelve months:

Provided also that if the company or the entity ceases to exist before the end of accounting
period, as aforesaid, then, the accounting period shall end immediately before the company
or, as the case may be, the entity, ceases to exist.

Explanation 7.— For the purposes of this clause,—

(a) no income shall be deemed to accrue or arise to a non-resident from transfer, outside
India, of any share of, or interest in, a company or an entity, registered or incorporated outside
India, referred to in the Explanation 5,—

(i) if such company or entity directly owns the assets situated in India and the transferor
(whether individually or along with its associated enterprises), at any time in the twelve
months preceding the date of transfer, neither holds the right of management or control in
relation to such company or entity, nor holds voting power or share capital or interest
exceeding five per cent. of the total voting power or total share capital or total interest, as
the case may be, of such company or entity; or

(ii) if such company or entity indirectly owns the assets situated in India and the transferor
(whether individually or along with its associated enterprises), at any time in the twelve
months preceding the date of transfer, neither holds the right of management or control in
relation to such company or entity, nor holds any right in, or in relation to, such company
or entity which would entitle him to the right of management or control in the company or
entity that directly owns the assets situated in India, nor holds such percentage of voting
power or share capital or interest in such company or entity which results in holding of
(either individually or along with associated enterprises) a voting power or share capital
or interest exceeding five per cent. of the total voting power or total share capital or total
interest, as the case may be, of the company or entity that directly owns the assets situated
in India;

(b) in a case where all the assets owned, directly or indirectly, by a company or, as the
case may be, an entity referred to in the Explanation 5, are not located in India, the income
of the non-resident transferor, from transfer outside India of a share of, or interest in, such
company or entity, deemed to accrue or arise in India under this clause, shall be only such
part of the income as is reasonably attributable to assets located in India and determined in
such manner as may be prescribed;

(c) “associated enterprise” shall have the meaning assigned to it in section 92A;’;

(B) in clause (v), after sub-clause (c), the following Explanation shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause,—

(a) itis hereby declared that in the case of a non-resident, being a person engaged in the
business of banking, any interest payable by the permanent establishment in India of such
non-resident to the head office or any permanent establishment or any other part of such
non-resident outside India shall be deemed to accrue or arise in India and shall be chargeable
to tax in addition to any income attributable to the permanent establishment in India and the
permanent establishmentin India shall be deemed to be a person separate and independent
of the non-resident person of which it is a permanent establishment and the provisions of the
Act relating to computation of total income, determination of tax and collection and recovery
shall apply accordingly;

(b) “permanent establishment” shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause (iiia) of section
92F.".



Insertion of
new section
9A.

Certain
activities not
to constitute
business
connection in
India.

8

6. After section 9 of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted with effect from the
1st day of April, 2016, namely:—

‘9A. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) of section 9 and subject to the

provisions of this section, in the case of an eligible investment fund, the fund management activity
carried out through an eligible fund manager acting on behalf of such fund shall not constitute
business connection in India of the said fund.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 6, an eligible investment fund shall not be said

to be resident in India for the purpose of that section merely because the eligible fund manager,
undertaking fund management activities on its behalf, is situated in India.

(3) The eligible investment fund referred to in sub-section (1), means a fund established or

incorporated or registered outside India, which collects funds from its members for investing it for
their benefit and fulfils the following conditions, namely:—

(a) the fund is not a person resident in India;

(b) the fund is a resident of a country or a specified territory with which an agreement referred
to in sub-section (1) of section 90 or sub-section (1) of section 90A has been entered into;

(c) the aggregate participation or investment in the fund, directly or indirectly, by persons
resident in India does not exceed five per cent. of the corpus of the fund;

(d) the fund and its activities are subject to applicable investor protection regulations in the
country or specified territory where it is established or incorporated or is a resident;

(e) the fund has a minimum of twenty-five members who are, directly or indirectly, not connected
persons;

(f) any member of the fund along with connected persons shall not have any participation
interest, directly or indirectly, in the fund exceeding ten per cent.;

(g) the aggregate participation interest, directly or indirectly, of ten or less members along with
their connected persons in the fund, shall be less than fifty per cent.;

(h) the fund shall not invest more than twenty per cent. of its corpus in any entity;
(i) the fund shall not make any investment in its associate entity;
(j) the monthly average of the corpus of the fund shall not be less than one hundred crore rupees:

Provided that if the fund has been established or incorporated in the previous year, the corpus
of fund shall not be less than one hundred crore rupees at the end of such previous year;

(k) the fund shall not carry on or control and manage, directly or indirectly, any business in
India or from India;

() the fund is neither engaged in any activity which constitutes a business connection in India
nor has any person acting on its behalf whose activities constitute a business connection in India
other than the activities undertaken by the eligible fund manager on its behalf;

(m) the remuneration paid by the fund to an eligible fund manager in respect of fund management
activity undertaken by him on its behalf is not less than the arm’s length price of the said activity.

(4) The eligible fund manager, in respect of an eligible investment fund, means any person who

is engaged in the activity of fund management and fulfils the following conditions, namely:—

(a) the person is not an employee of the eligible investment fund or a connected person of the
fund;

(b) the person is registered as a fund manager or an investment advisor in accordance with
the specified regulations;

(c) the person is acting in the ordinary course of his business as a fund manager;

(d) the person along with his connected persons shall not be entitled, directly or indirectly, to
more than twenty per cent. of the profits accruing or arising to the eligible investment fund from
the transactions carried out by the fund through the fund manager;

(5) Every eligible investment fund shall, in respect of its activities in a financial year, furnish within

ninety days from the end of the financial year, a statement in the prescribed form, to the prescribed
income-tax authority containing information relating to the fulfilment of the conditions specified in
this section and also provide such other relevant information or documents as may be prescribed.

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50



15 of 1992.

5 of 1873.

15 of 1992.

15 of 1992.

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

9

(6) Nothing contained in this section shall apply to exclude any income from the total income of

the eligible investment fund, which would have been so included irrespective of whether the activity
of the eligible fund manager constituted the business connection in India of such fund or not.

(7) Nothing contained in this section shall have any effect on the scope of total income or

determination of total income in the case of the eligible fund manager.

(8) For the purposes of this section,—

(a) “associate” means an entity in which a director or a trustee or a partner or a member or a
fund manager of the investment fund or a director or a trustee or a partner or a member of the
fund manager of such fund, holds, either individually or collectively, share or interest, being more
than fifteen per cent. of its share capital or interest, as the case may be;

(b) “corpus” means the total amount of funds raised for the purpose of investment by the
eligible investment fund as on a particular date;

(c) “connected person” shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause (4) of section 102;
(d) “entity” means any entity in which an eligible investment fund makes an investment;

(e) “specified regulations” means the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Portfolio
Managers) Regulations, 1993 or the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Investment Advisers)
Regulations, 2013, or such other regulations made under the Securities and Exchange Board of
India Act, 1992 which may be notified by the Central Government under this clause.

. In section 10 of the Income-tax Act,—

() after clause (11), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(11A) any payment from an account, opened in accordance with the Sukanya Samriddhi
Account Rules, 2014 made under the Government Savings Bank Act, 1873;";

(Iy in clause (23C), after sub-clause (iiia), the following sub-clauses shall be inserted, namely:—
“(iiaa) the Swachh Bharat Kosh, set up by the Central Government; or
(ilaaa) the Clean Ganga Fund, set up by the Central Government; or”;

(1) with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016—
(a) after clause (23ED), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(23EE) any specified income of such Core Settlement Guarantee Fund, set up by a
recognised clearing corporation in accordance with the regulations, as the Central Government
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify in this behalf:

Provided that where any amount standing to the credit of the Fund and not charged to
income-tax during any previous year is shared, either wholly or in part with the specified person,
the whole of the amount so shared shall be deemed to be the income of the previous year in
which such amount is so shared and shall, accordingly, be chargeable to income-tax.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause,—

(i) “recognised clearing corporation” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in
clause (0) of sub-regulation (1) of regulation 2 of the Securities Contracts (Regulation)
(Stock Exchanges and Clearing Corporations) Regulations, 2012 made under the Securities
and Exchange Board of India Act, 1992;

(i) “regulations” means the Securities Contracts (Regulation) (Stock Exchanges and
Clearing Corporations) Regulations, 2012 made under the Securities and Exchange Board
of India Act, 1992;

(iii) “specified income” shall mean,—
(a) the income by way of contribution received from specified persons;

(b) the income by way of penalties imposed by the recognised clearing corporation
and credited to the Core Settlement Guarantee Fund; or

(c) the income from investment made by the Fund;
(iv) “specified person” shall mean,—

(a) any recognised clearing corporation which establishes and maintains the Core
Settlement Guarantee Fund; and

Amendment of
section 10.



10

(b) any recognised stock exchange being shareholder in such recognised clearing
corporation;’;

(b) in clause (23FB), before the Explanation, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that nothing contained in this clause shall apply in respect of any income of a
venture capital company or venture capital fund, being an investment fund specified in clause
(a) of the Explanation 1 to section 115UB, of the previous year relevant to the assessment year
beginning on or after the 1st day of April, 2016;";

(c) after clause (23FB), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(23FBA) any income of an investment fund other than the income chargeable under the
head “Profits and gains of business or profession”;

(23FBB) any income referred to in section 115UB, accruing or arising to, or received by, a
unit holder of an investment fund, being that proportion of income which is of the same nature
as income chargeable under the head “Profits and gains of business or profession”.

Explanation.—For the purposes of clauses (23FBA) and (23FBB), the expression “investment
fund” shall have the meaning assigned to itin clause (a) of the Explanation 1 to section 115UB;’;

(d) after clause (23FC), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(23FCA) any income of a business trust, being a real estate investment trust, by way of
renting or leasing or letting out any real estate asset owned directly by such business trust.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this clause, the expression “real estate asset” shall have
the same meaning as assigned to it in clause (zj) of sub-regulation (1) of regulation 2 of the
Securities and Exchange Board of India (Real Estate Investment Trusts) Regulations, 2014
made under the Securities and Exchange Board of India Act, 1992;’;

(e) in clause (23FD), after the word, brackets, figures and letters “clause (23FC)”, the words,
brackets, figures and letters “or clause (23FCA)” shall be inserted;

(f) in clause (38), the second proviso shall be omitted.

Amendment 8. In section 11 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016,—
of section 11.

(I) in sub-section (1), in Explanation, in clause (2), after sub-clause (b), in the long line, for the
brackets and words “(such option to be exercised in writing before the expiry of the time allowed under
sub-section (1) of section 139 for furnishing the return of income)”, the brackets and words “(such
option to be excercised before the expiry of the time allowed under sub-section (1) of section 139 for
furnishing the return of income, in such form and manner as may be prescribed)” shall be substituted;

(I1) in sub-section (2), for clauses (a) and (b) and the first and second provisos, the following shall
be substituted, namely:—

“(a) such person furnishes a statement in the prescribed form and in the prescribed manner to
the Assessing Officer, stating the purpose for which the income is being accumulated or set apart
and the period for which the income is to be accumulated or set apart, which shall in no case
exceed five years;

(b) the money so accumulated or set apart is invested or deposited in the forms or modes
specified in sub-section (5);

(c) the statement referred to in clause (a) is furnished on or before the due date specified under
sub-section (1) of section 139 for furnishing the return of income for the previous year:

Provided that in computing the period of five years referred to in clause (a), the period during
which the income could not be applied for the purpose for which it is so accumulated or set apart,
due to an order or injunction of any court, shall be excluded.”.

Amendment 9. In section 13 of the Income-tax Act, after sub-section (8) and before Explanation 1, the following
of section 13. gyh-section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016, namely:—

“(9) Nothing contained in sub-section (2) of section 11 shall operate so as to exclude any income
from the total income of the previous year of a person in receipt thereof, if—

(i) the statement referred to in clause (a) of the said sub-section in respect of such income is
not furnished on or before the due date specified under sub-section (1) of section 139 for furnishing
the return of income for the previous year; or

(ii) the return of income for the previous year is not furnished by such person on or before the
due date specified under sub-section (1) of section 139 for furnishing the return of income for the
said previous year.”.

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

15 of 1992.



10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

55

11

10. In section 32 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), with effect from the 1st day of

April, 2016,—

(a) in clause (ii),—

(A) in the second proviso, after the words, brackets, figures and letter “asset referred to in
clause (i) or clause (ii) or clause (iia)”, the words, brackets, figures and letter “or the first proviso
to clause (iia)” shall be inserted,;

(B) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided also that where an asset referred to in clause (iia) or the first proviso to clause
(iia), as the case may be, is acquired by the assessee during the previous year and is put to
use for the purposes of business for a period of less than one hundred and eighty days in that
previous year, and the deduction under this sub-section in respect of such asset is restricted
to fifty per cent. of the amount calculated at the percentage prescribed for an asset under
clause (iia) for that previous year, then, the deduction for the balance fifty per cent. of the
amount calculated at the percentage prescribed for such asset under clause (iia) shall be
allowed under this sub-section in the immediately succeeding previous year in respect of such
asset:”;

(b) in clause (iia),—
(A) in the proviso, for the word “Provided”, the words “Provided further” shall be substituted;
(B) before the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that where an assessee, sets up an undertaking or enterprise for manufacture or
production of any article or thing, on or after the 1st day of April, 2015 in any backward area
notified by the Central Government in this behalf, in the State of Andhra Pradesh or in the
State of Telangana, and acquires and installs any new machinery or plant (other than ships
and aircraft) for the purposes of the said undertaking or enterprise during the period beginning
on the 1st day of April, 2015 and ending before the 1st day of April, 2020 in the said backward
area, then, the provisions of clause (iia) shall have effect, as if for the words “twenty per cent.”,
the words “thirty-five per cent.” had been substituted:”.

11. After section 32AC of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted with effect from

the 1st day of April, 2016, namely:—

‘32AD. (1) Where an assessee, sets up an undertaking or enterprise for manufacture or production
of any article or thing, on or after the 1st day of April, 2015 in any backward area notified by the
Central Government in this behalf, in the State of Andhra Pradesh or in the State of Telangana, and
acquires and installs any new asset for the purposes of the said undertaking or enterprise during
the period beginning on the 1st day of April, 2015 and ending before the 1st day of April, 2020 in the
said backward area, then, there shall be allowed a deduction of a sum equal to fifteen per cent. of
the actual cost of such new asset for the assessment year relevant to the previous year in which
such new asset is installed.

(2) If any new asset acquired and installed by the assessee is sold or otherwise transferred,
except in connection with the amalgamation or demerger or re-organisation of business referred to
in clause (xiii) or clause (xiiib) or clause (xiv) of section 47, within a period of five years from the date
of its installation, the amount of deduction allowed under sub-section (1) in respect of such new
asset shall be deemed to be the income of the assessee chargeable under the head “Profits and
gains of business or profession” of the previous year in which such new asset is sold or otherwise
transferred, in addition to taxability of gains, arising on account of transfer of such new asset.

(3) Where the new asset is sold or otherwise transferred in connection with the amalgamation or
demerger or re-organisation of business referred to in clause (xiii) or clause (xiiib) or clause (xiv) of
section 47 within a period of five years from the date of its installation, the provisions of sub-section
(2) shall apply to the amalgamated company or the resulting company or the successor referred to
in clause (xiii) or clause (xiiib) or clause (xiv) of section 47, as the case may be, as they would have
applied to the amalgamating company or the demerged company or the predecessor referred to in
clause (xiii) or clause (xiiib) or clause (xiv) of section 47.

(4) For the purposes of this section, “new asset” means any new plant or machinery (other than
a ship or aircraft) but does not include—

(a) any plant or machinery, which before its installation by the assessee, was used either
within or outside India by any other person;

Amendment
of section 32.

Insertion of
new section
32AD.

Investment in
new plant or
machinery in
notified
backward
areas in
certain States.



12

(b) any plant or machinery installed in any office premises or any residential accommodation,
including accommodation in the nature of a guest house;

(c) any office appliances including computers or computer software;
(d) any vehicle; or

(e) any plant or machinery, the whole of the actual cost of which is allowed as deduction
(whether by way of depreciation or otherwise) in computing the income chargeable under the
head “Profits and gains of business or profession” of any previous year.’.

Amendment of  12. In section 35 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016,—
section 35.

(i) in sub-section (2AA), in the proviso, after the words “submit its report to the”, the words “Principal
Chief Commissioner or Chief Commissioner or” shall be inserted,;

(i) in sub-section (2AB),—

(a) in clause (3), for the words “for audit of accounts maintained for that facility”, the words
“fulfils such conditions with regard to maintenance of accounts and audit thereof and furnishing
of reports in such manner as may be prescribed” shall be substituted,;

(b) in clause (4), after the words “approval of the said facility to the”, the words “Principal Chief
Commissioner or Chief Commissioner or” shall be inserted.

Amendment of 13, In section 47 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016,—
section 47.

(a) after clause (viaa), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(viab) any transfer, in a scheme of amalgamation, of a capital asset, being a share of a
foreign company, referred to in Explanation 5 to clause (i) of sub-section (1) of section 9,
which derives, directly or indirectly, its value substantially from the share or shares of an
Indian company, held by the amalgamating foreign company to the amalgamated foreign
company, if—

(A) at least twenty-five per cent. of the shareholders of the amalgamating foreign company
continue to remain shareholders of the amalgamated foreign company; and

(B) such transfer does not attract tax on capital gains in the country in which the
amalgamating company is incorporated;”;

(b) after clause (vicb), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(vicc) any transfer in a demerger, of a capital asset, being a share of a foreign company,
referred to in Explanation 5 to clause (i) of sub-section (1) of section 9, which derives, directly
or indirectly, its value substantially from the share or shares of an Indian company, held by
the demerged foreign company to the resulting foreign company, if,—

(a) the shareholders, holding not less than three-fourths in value of the shares of the
demerged foreign company, continue to remain shareholders of the resulting foreign
company; and

(b) such transfer does not attract tax on capital gains in the country in which the demerged
foreign company is incorporated:

Provided that the provisions of sections 391 to 394 of the Companies Act, 1956 shall not
apply in case of demergers referred to in this clause;”;

(c) after clause (xvii), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(xviii) any transfer by a unit holder of a capital asset, being a unit or units, held by him in the
consolidating scheme of a mutual fund, made in consideration of the allotment to him of a
capital asset, being a unit or units, in the consolidated scheme of the mutual fund:

Provided that the consolidation is of two or more schemes of equity oriented fund or of two or
more schemes of a fund other than equity oriented fund.

Explanation.— For the purposes of this clause,—

(a) “consolidating scheme” means the scheme of a mutual fund which merges under the
process of consolidation of the schemes of mutual fund in accordance with the Securities and
Exchange Board of India (Mutual Funds) Regulations, 1996 made under the Securities and
Exchange Board of India Act, 1992;

10

15

20

25

30

35

1 of 1956.

40

45

50 15 of 1992.



10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

13

(b)"consolidated scheme” means the scheme with which the consolidating scheme merges
or which is formed as a result of such merger;

(c) “equity oriented fund” shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause (38) of
section 10;

(d) “mutual fund” means a mutual fund specified under clause (23D) of clause 10..

14. In section 49 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016,— Amendment
of section 49.

(1) in sub-section (1), in clause (iii), in sub-clause (e), for the words, brackets, figures and letters
“or clause (viaa) or clause (vica) or clause (vicb)”, the words, brackets, figures and letters “or clause
(viaa) or clause (viab) or clause (vib) or clause (vica) or clause (vicb) or clause (vicc)” shall be
substituted;

() after sub-section (2AC), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2AD) Where the capital asset, being a unit or units in a consolidated scheme of a mutual
fund, became the property of the assessee in consideration of a transfer referred to in clause
(xviii) of section 47, the cost of acquisition of the asset shall be deemed to be the cost of acquisition
to him of the unit or units in the consolidating scheme of the mutual fund.”.

15. In section 80C of the Income-tax Act,— Amendment of
section 80C.

() in sub-section (2), in clause (viii), for the words “as subscription to”, the words, brackets and
figure “as subscription, in the name of any person specified in sub-section (4), to” shall be substituted;

(1) in sub-section (4), after clause (b), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(ba) for the purposes of clause (viii) of that sub-section, in the case of an individual, the
individual or any girl child of that individual, or any girl child for whom such person is the legal
guardian, if the scheme so specifies;”.

16. In section 80CCC of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), for the words “one lakh rupees”, the Amendment of
words “one hundred and fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of chctgg
April, 2016. '

17. In section 80CCD of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016,-— Amendment of
section
(a) sub-section (1A) shall be omitted; 80CCD.

(b) after sub-section (1A), as so omitted the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(1B) An assesse referred to in sub-section (1), shall be allowed a deduction in computation of
his total income, [in addition to the deduction allowed under sub-section (1)], of the whole of the
amount paid or deposited in the previous year in his account under a pension scheme notified or
as may be notified by the Central Government, which shall not exceed fifty thousand rupees:

Provided that no deduction under this sub-section shall be allowed in respect of the amount on
which a deduction has been claimed and allowed under sub-section (1);

(c) in sub-section (3),—

() for the words, brackets and figure, “sub-section (1)”, wherever they occur, the words,
brackets, figures and letter “sub-section (1) or sub-section (1B)” shall be substituted,;

(Iy for the words “under that sub-section”, the words “under those sub-sections” shall be
substituted;

(d) in sub-section (4), for the words, brackets and figure, “sub-section (1)", the words, brackets,
figures and letter “sub-section (1) or sub-section (1B)” shall be substituted.

18. In section 80D of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April 2016,— Amendment of
section 80D.
(A) in sub-section (2), after clause (b), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(c) the whole of the amount paid on account of medical expenditure incurred on the health of
the assessee or any member of his family as does not exceed in the aggregate thirty thousand
rupees; and



14

(d) the whole of the amount paid on account of medical expenditure incurred on the health of
any parent of the assessee, as does not exceed in the aggregate thirty thousand rupees:

Provided that the amount referred to in clause (¢) or clause (d) is paid in respect of a very
senior citizen and no amount has been paid to effect or to keep in force an insurance on the
health of such person:

Provided further that the aggregate of the sum specified under clause (a) and clause (c) or the
aggregate of the sum specified under clause (b) and clause(d) shall not exceed thirty thousand
rupees.”;

(B) for sub-section(3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) Where the assessee is a Hindu undivided family, the sum referred to in sub-section (1),
shall be the aggregate of the following, namely:—

(a) whole of the amount paid to effect or to keep in force an insurance on the health of any
member of that Hindu undivided family as does not exceed in the aggregate twenty-five thousand
rupees; and

(b) the whole of the amount paid on account of medical expenditure incurred on the health
of any member of the Hindu undivided family as does not exceed in the aggregate thirty
thousand rupees:

Provided that the amount referred to in clause (b) is paid in respect of a very senior citizen and
no amount has been paid to effect or to keep in force an insurance on the health of such person:

Provided further that the aggregate of the sum specified under clause (a) and clause (b) shall
not exceed thirty thousand rupees.”;

(C) in sub-section(4), —

(i) for the words, brackets and figure “or in sub-section (3)", the words, brackets, letter and
figure “or clause (a) of sub-section (3)" shall be substituted,;

(i) after the words “senior citizen,”, the words “or a very senior citizen,” shall be inserted,;

(iii) for the words “fifteen thousand rupees”, the words “twenty-five thousand rupees” shall be
substituted,

(iv) for the words “twenty thousand rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted,

(v) the Explanation shall be omitted,;
(D) after sub-section (5), the following Explanation shall be inserted, namely:—
‘Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(i) “senior citizen” means an individual resident in India who is of the age of sixty years or
more at any time during the relevant previous year;

(i) “very senior citizen” means an individual resident in India who is of the age of eighty
years or more at any time during the relevant previous year.’.

Amendment 19. In section 80DD of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016, for

ggsD%:non sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) Where an assessee, being an individual or a Hindu undivided family, who is a resident in
India, has, during the previous year,—

(a) incurred any expenditure for the medical treatment (including nursing), training and
rehabilitation of a dependant, being a person with disability; or

(b) paid or deposited any amount under a scheme framed in this behalf by the Life Insurance
Corporation or any other insurer or the Administrator or the specified company subject to the
conditions specified in sub-section (2) and approved by the Board in this behalf for the maintenance
of a dependant, being a person with disability,

the assessee shall, in accordance with and subject to the provisions of this section, be allowed a
deduction of a sum of seventy-five thousand rupees from his gross total income in respect of the
previous year:

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45



18 of 2013.

18 of 2013.

61 of 1985.

10

15

20

25

35

40

45

15

Provided that where such dependant is a person with severe disability, the provisions of this
sub-section shall have effect as if for the words “seventy-five thousand rupees”, the words “one
hundred and twenty-five thousand rupees” had been substituted.”.

20. In section 80DDB of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016, —
(i) for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that no such deduction shall be allowed unless the assessee obtains the prescription
for such medical treatment from a neurologist, an oncologist, a urologist, a haematologist, an
immunologist or such other specialist, as may be prescribed.”.

(i) after the third proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided also that where the amount actually paid is in respect of the assessee or his dependant
or any member of a Hindu undivided family of the assessee and who is a very senior citizen, the
provisions of this section shall have effect as if for the words “forty thousand rupees”, the words
“eighty thousand rupees” had been substituted.’;

(iii) in the Explanation,—
(a) clause (ii) shall be omitted;
(b) after clause (iv), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(v) “very senior citizen” means an individual resident in India who is of the age of eighty
years or more at any time during the relevant previous year.’.

21. In section 80G of the Income-tax Act,—
(A) in sub-section (1), in clause (i),—

(I) after the words, brackets, figures and letters “sub-clause (iiihj) or”, the words, brackets,
figures and letters “sub-clause (iiihk) or sub-clause (iiihl) or” shall be inserted;

(I) after the words, brackets, figures and letters “sub-clause (iiihl) or”, as so inserted, the
words, brackets, figures and letters “sub-clause (iiihm) or” shall be inserted with effect from the
1st day of April, 2016;

(B) in sub-section (2), in clause (a),—
(1) after sub-clause (iiihj), the following sub-clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(iiihk) the Swachh Bharat Kosh, set up by the Central Government, other than the sum
spent by the assessee in pursuance of Corporate Social Responsibility under sub-section (5)
of section 135 of the Companies Act, 2013; or

(iiihl) the Clean Ganga Fund, set up by the Central Government, where such assessee is a
resident and such sum is other than the sum spent by the assessee in pursuance of Corporate
Social Responsibility under sub-section (5) of section 135 of the Companies
Act, 2013; or”;

(I1) the following sub-clause shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016, namely:—

“(iiihm) the National Fund for Control of Drug Abuse constituted under section 7A of the
Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances Act, 1985; or”.

22. In section 80JJAA of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016,—
(a) in sub-section (1), the words “being an Indian company,” shall be omitted;
(b) in sub-section (2), for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(a) if the factory is acquired by the assessee by way of transfer from any other person or as
a result of any business re-organisation;”;

(c) in the Explanation, in clause (i), for the words “one hundred workmen”, the words “fifty workmen”
shall be substituted.

23. In section 80U of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016, for sub-section
(1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) In computing the total income of an individual, being a resident, who, at any time during the
previous year, is certified by the medical authority to be a person with disability, there shall be
allowed a deduction of a sum of seventy-five thousand rupees:

Amendment
of section
80DDB.

Amendment of
section 80G.

Amendment of
section
80JJAA.

Amendment of
section 80U.



Amendment
of section
92BA.

Amendment

of section 95.

Amendment
of section
111A.

Amendment
of section
115A.

Amendment
of section
115ACA.

Amendment
of section
115JB.

16

Provided that where such individual is a person with severe disability, the provisions of this
sub-section shall have effect as if for the words “seventy-five thousand rupees”, the words “one
hundred and twenty-five thousand rupees” had been substituted.”.

24. In section 92BA of the Income-tax Act, for the words “five crore rupees” occurring at the end, the
words “twenty crore rupees” shall be substituted with effect from thelst day of April, 2016.

25. Section 95 of the Income-tax Act shall be numbered as sub-section (1) thereof, and after
sub-section (1) as so numbered and before the Explanation, the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(2) This Chapter shall apply in respect of any assessment year beginning on or after the 1st day
of April, 2018.".

26. In section 111A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), the second proviso shall be omitted
with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016.

27. In section 115A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (b), with effect from the
1st day of April, 2016,—

(a) in sub-clause (A), for the words “twenty-five per cent.”, the words “ten per cent.” shall be
substituted,;

(b) in sub-clause (B), for the words “twenty-five per cent.”, the words “ten per cent.” shall be
substituted.

28. In section 115ACA of the Income-tax Act, after sub-section (3), in the Explanation, in clause (a),
with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016, for the words “issued to non-resident investors against the
issue of ordinary shares or foreign currency convertible bonds of issuing company” occuring at the
end, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“issued to investors against the issue of,—

(i) ordinary shares of issuing company, being a company listed on a recognised stock exchange
in India; or

(i) foreign currency convertible bonds of issuing company;”.

29. In section 115JB of the Income-tax Act, in the Explanation 1 below sub-section (2), with effect
from the 1st day of April, 2016,—

(a) after clause (f), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(fa) the amount or amounts of expenditure relatable to, income, being share of the assessee
in the income of an association of persons or body of individuals, on which no income-tax is
payable in accordance with the provisions of section 86;

(fb) the amount or amounts of expenditure relatable to income from capital gains arising on
transactions in securities (other than short term capital gains arising on transactions on which
securities transaction tax is not chargeable), accruing or arising to an assessee being a Foreign
Institutional Investor which has invested in such securities in accordance with the regulations
made under the Securities and Exchange Board of India Act,1992;";

(b) after clause (iib), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(iic) the amount of income, being the share of the assessee in the income of an association of
persons or body of individuals, on which no income-tax is payable in accordance with the provisions
of section 86, if any such amount is credited to the profit and loss account; or

(iid) the amount of income from capital gains arising on transactions in securities (other than
short term capital gains arising on transactions on which securities transaction tax is not
chargeable), accruing or arising to an assessee being a Foreign Institutional Investor which
has invested in such securities in accordance with the regulations made under the Securities
and Exchange Board of India Act, 1992, if any such amount is credited to the profit and loss
account; or”;

(c) after Explanation 3, the following Explanation shall be inserted, namely:—
‘Explanation 4.—For the purposes of sub-section (2),—

(a) the expression “Foreign Institutional Investor” shall have the meaning assigned to it in
clause (a) of the Explanation to section 115AD;

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

15 of 1992.

15 of 1992.



42 of 1956.

5

17

(b) the expression “securities” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in clause (h)
of section 2 of the Securities Contracts (Regulation) Act, 1956.".

30. In section 115U of the Income-tax Act, after sub-section (5), before the Explanation 1, the

following sub-section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016, namely:—

“(6) Nothing contained in this Chapter shall apply in respect of any income, of a previous year
relevant to the assessment year beginning on or after the 1st day of April, 2016, accruing or arising
to, or received by, a person from investments made in a venture capital company or venture capital
fund, being an investment fund specified in clause (a) of the Explanation 1 to section 115UB.".

31. In section 115UA of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (3), after the words, brackets, figures and

10 letters “in clause (23FC)”, the words, brackets, figures and letters “or clause (23FCA)” shall be inserted

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016.

32. After Chapter XII-FA of the Income-tax Act, the following Chapter shall be inserted with effect

from the 1st day of April, 2016, namely:—

‘CHAPTER XII-FB

SPECIAL PROVISIONS RELATING TO TAX ON INCOME OF INVESTMENT FUNDS AND
INCOME RECEIVED FROM SUCH FUNDS

115UB. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other provisions of this Act and subject to
the provisions of this Chapter, any income accruing or arising to, or received by, a person, being a
unit holder of an investment fund, out of investments made in the investment fund, shall be chargeable
to income-tax in the same manner as if it were the income accruing or arising to, or received by,
such person had the investments made by the investment fund been made directly by him.

(2) Where in any previous year, the net result of computation of total income of the investment
fund [without giving effect to the provisions of clause (23FBA) of section 10] is a loss under any
head of income and such loss cannot be or is not wholly set-off against income under any other
head of income of the said previous year, then,—

(i) such loss shall be allowed to be carried forward and it shall be set-off by the investment fund
in accordance with the provisions of Chapter VI; and

(i) such loss shall be ignored for the purposes of sub-section (1).

(3) The income paid or credited by the investment fund shall be deemed to be of the same nature
and in the same proportion in the hands of the person referred to in sub-section (1), as it had been
received by, or had accrued or arisen to, the investment fund during the previous year subject to the
provisions of sub-section (2).

(4) The total income of the investment fund shall be charged to tax—

(i) atthe rate or rates as specified in the Finance Act of the relevant year, where such fund
is a company or a firm; or

(i) at maximum marginal rate in any other case.

(5) The provisions of Chapter XII-D or Chapter XII-E shall not apply to the income paid by an
investment fund under this Chapter.

(6) The income accruing or arising to, or received by, the investment fund, during a previous
year, if not paid or credited to the person referred to in sub-section (1), shall subject to the provisions
of sub-section (2), be deemed to have been credited to the account of the said person on the last
day of the previous year in the same proportion in which such person would have been entitled to
receive the income had it been paid in the previous year.

(7) The person responsible for crediting or making payment of the income on behalf of an
investment fund and the investment fund shall furnish, within such time as may be prescribed, to
the person who is liable to tax in respect of such income and to the prescribed income-tax authority,
a statement in the prescribed form and verified in such manner, giving details of the nature of the
income paid or credited during the previous year and such other relevant details, as may be
prescribed.

Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this Chapter,—

Amendment of
section 115U.

Amendment of
section
115UA.

Insertion of
new Chapter
XII-FB.

Tax on
income of
investment
fund and its
unit holders.



18

(a) “investment fund” means any fund established or incorporated in India in the form of a trust
or a company or a limited liability partnership or a body corporate which has been granted a
certificate of registration as a Category | or a Category Il Alternative Investment Fund and is
regulated under the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Alternative Investment Fund)
Regulations, 2012, made under the Securities and Exchange Board of India Act, 1992; 5 15 of 1992.

(b) “trust” means a trust established under the Indian Trusts Act, 1882 or under any other law 2 of 1882.
for the time being in force;

(c) “unit” means beneficial interest of an investor in the investment fund or a scheme of the
investment fund and shall include shares or partnership interests.

Explanation 2.—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that any income which has 10
been included in total income of the person referred to in sub-section (1) in a previous year, on
account of it having accrued or arisen in the said previous year, shall not be included in the total
income of such person in the previous year in which such income is actually paid to him by the
investment fund.’.

Amendment 33. In section 132B of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (i), with effect from the 15
%chnon 1st day of June, 2015, for the words “deemed to be in default, may be recovered out of such assets”

' occurring at the end, the words, brackets, figures and letter “deemed to be in default, or the amount of
liability arising on an application made before the Settlement Commission under sub-section (1) of
section 245C, may be recovered out of such assets” shall be substituted.

Amendment 34. In section 139 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 2016,— 20
of section
139. (1) in sub-section (4C), in clause (e),—

(a) after the words “other educational institution referred to in”, the words, brackets, figures
and letters “sub-clause (iiiab) or” shall be inserted;

(b) after the words “other medical institution referred to in”, the words, brackets, figures and
letters “sub-clause (iiiac) or” shall be inserted; 25

(I1) after sub-section (4E), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4F) Every investment fund referred to in section 115UB, which is not required to furnish
return of income or loss under any other provisions of this section, shall furnish the return of
income in respect of its income or loss in every previous year and all the provisions of this Act
shall, so far as may be, apply as if it were a return required to be furnished under 30
sub-section (1).”.

Substitution of ~ 35. For section 151 of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be substituted with effect from

new section [
for section 151. the 1st day of June, 2015, namely:

Sanction for “151. (1) No notice shall be issued under section 148 by an Assessing Officer, after the expiry of
'nsjﬁfe(_)f a period of four years from the end of the relevant assessment year, unless the Principal Chief 35
Commissioner or Chief Commissioner or Principal Commissioner or Commissioner is satisfied, on
the reasons recorded by the Assessing Officer, that it is a fit case for the issue of such notice.

(2) In a case other than a case falling under sub-section (1), no notice shall be issued under
section 148 by an Assessing Officer, who is below the rank of Joint Commissioner, unless the Joint
Commissioner is satisfied, on the reasons recorded by such Assessing Officer, that it is a fit case for 40
the issue of such notice.

(3) For the purposes of sub-section (1) and sub-section (2), the Principal Chief Commissioner or
Chief Commissioner or the Principal Commissioner or Commissioner or the Joint Commissioner, as
the case may be, being satisfied on the reasons recorded by the Assessing Officer about fithess of
a case for the issue of notice under section 148, need not issue such notice himself.”. 45

Amendment 36. In section 153C of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), with effect from the 1st day of June,

2f5§éqm 2015 for the portion beginning with the words and figures “Notwithstanding anything contained in
section 139” and ending with the words “the Assessing Officer having jurisdiction over such other
person”, the words, figures, brackets and letters “Notwithstanding anything contained in section
139, section 147, section 148, section 149, section 151 and section 153, where the Assessing Officer 50
is satisfied that,—



19

(a) any money, bullion, jewellery or other valuable article or thing, seized or requisitioned, belongs
to; or

(b) any books of account or documents, seized or requisitioned, pertains or pertain to, or any
information contained therein, relates to,

5 aperson other than the person referred to in section 153A, then, the books of account or documents or

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

50

assets, seized or requisitioned shall be handed over to the Assessing Officer having jurisdiction over
such other person” shall be inserted.

37. In section 154 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of June, 2015,—
(i) in sub-section (1), after clause (c), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—
“(d) amend any intimation under sub-section (1) of section 206CB.";

(i) in sub-section (2), in clause (b), after the words “or by the deductor”, the words “or by the
collector” shall be inserted,;

(iii) in sub-section (3), after the words “or the deductor” wherever they occur, the words “or the
collector” shall be inserted,;

(iv) in sub-section (5), after the words “or the deductor” at both the places where they occur, the
words “or the collector” shall be inserted,;

(v) in sub-section (6), after the words “or the deductor” at both the places where they occur, the
words “or the collector” shall be inserted,;

(vi) in sub-section (8), after the words “or by the deductor”, the words “or by the collector” shall be
inserted.

38. In section 156 of the Income-tax Act, in the proviso, with effect from the 1st day of June, 2015,

for the words, brackets, figures and letter “by the deductor under sub-section (1) of section 143 or
sub-section (1) of section 200A”, the words, brackets, figures and letters “the deductor or the collector
under sub-section (1) of section 143 or sub-section (1) of section 200A or sub-section (1) of section
206CB” shall be substituted.

39. After section 158A of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted with effect from

the 1st day of June, 2015, namely:—

“158AA. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, where the Commissioner or Principal
Commissioner is of the opinion that any question of law arising in the case of an assessee for any
assessment year (such case being herein referred to as relevant case) is identical with a question
of law arising in his case for another assessment year which i